
 

 

 

 
 

   
  COUNCIL WEEKLY UPDATE 

July 1, 2021 
 

 
 

ENGINEERING 

Buccaneer Park (Project Study Report) – The first public outreach meeting will be a “pop-up” 
held on July 10 from 10:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m. at Buccaneer Park.  Flyer 

 

WATER UTILITIES 
 

Monica Circle Sewer Replacement - Bid opening for the Monica Circle Sewer Replacement 
project was held on June 24, 2021. Staff has observed defects in the pipeline with CCTV video 
which prioritized it for replacement. Five (5) bids were received with the apparent low bid coming 
in below the budget estimate for the project. Staff is reviewing bid documents and anticipates 
recommending an award of the contract at a City Council meeting in August.  Construction is 
expected to begin in September 2021 and be complete by December 2021. 
 

Sewer Point Repair Program - A contract was awarded to DB Pipeline Inc. for the Sewer Point 
Repair Package No. 5, which includes repairs of existing gravity sewer mains at five (5) locations 
throughout the City.  Notice to Proceed was issued on June 25, 2021 to begin construction. 
Construction is expected to be complete by September 2021.  A contract was awarded to GDM 
Inc. for the Sewer Point Repair Package No. 6, which includes repairs of existing gravity sewer 
mains at five (5) locations throughout the City.  Notice to Proceed was issued on June 23, 2021 
to begin construction. Construction is expected to be complete by September 2021 
 

No Delays in Solid Waste, Recycling, and Green Waste Collection for Independence Day 
Holiday – As Independence Day falls on Sunday, July 4, 2021, Oceanside residents will not 
experience delays in solid waste, recycling, and green waste service collection. Residents 
should place their carts curbside on their normal collection day. For more information on 
residential services and a list of holidays with one-day delays, please visit: 
https://www.ci.oceanside.ca.us/gov/water/services_programs/recycling/guidelines/default.asp 
 

NEIGHBORHOOD SERVICES 
 

Activities for Seniors - The Country Club Senior Center is now open. The center’s hours are 
Monday - Thursday from 8:30 a.m. -4:00 p.m. and Friday from 8:30 a.m. - noon. The center will 
provide seniors the opportunity to socialize and engage in activities such as table tennis, 
scrabble, puzzles, movies and much more. Additionally, drive through lunch distribution 
continues, and seniors may now bring these meals into the center and enjoy lunch while 
socializing with others in a safe, cool and engaging environment. The El Corazon Senior Center 
is expected to open within the next two weeks. 
 

UPCOMING COMMISSION/COMMITTEE MEETINGS  
*Meetings are open to the public with a limited capacity, attendees can participate via Zoom or in-person   

July 12 Planning Commission.  6:00 p.m. 

July 15 Police and Fire Commission. 4:00 p.m. 

July 27 Library Board of Trustees.  2:00 p.m. 

https://www.ci.oceanside.ca.us/civicax/filebank/blobdload.aspx?BlobID=55524
https://www.ci.oceanside.ca.us/gov/water/services_programs/recycling/guidelines/default.asp


 

 

 

 
 

 

July 27 Housing Commission. 6:15 p.m. 

Aug 10 Economic Development Commission.  3:00 p.m. 

Aug 17 Utilities Commission. 3:30 p.m. 
 

COMMUNITY MEETINGS / EVENTS 
 
 

July 3 Fireworks display over El Corazon. 9:00 p.m.  Info 
 

July 5-10 Samoan Cultural Festival Youth Games. Melba Bishop Park. 
 

Aug 12 North County Health & Wellness Fair. 9:00 a.m. – 1:00 p.m.  Info 
 

Aug 21 Armed Forces Operation Appreciation.  11:00 a.m. – 4:00 p.m.  Info 

https://www.ci.oceanside.ca.us/news/displaynews.asp?NewsID=2008&TargetID=1
https://www.oceansidechamber.com/north-county-health-fair.html?utm_source=greenrope&utm_medium=email&utm_content=16455&utm_campaign=7525805
https://www.oceansidechamber.com/armed-forces-day-operation-appreciation.html

